
NONPARTISAN BALLOT

INSTRUCTIONS TO VOTERS: 
To vote, complete the oval to the
LEFT of your choice, like this (R).
To cast a write-in vote, complete
the oval to the LEFT of the blank
space provided and write the
candidate's name in that space. 
For specific information, refer to
the card of instruction posted in
the voting booth.  If you tear, soil, 
deface or erroneously mark this
ballot, return it to the Election
Judge and obtain another.  Vote
both sides of ballot if applicable.

PUBLIC QUESTION(S)

LOGAN COUNTY

Shall the County of Logan have
the authority to arrange for the
supply of electricity for its
residential and small commercial
retail customers who have not
opted out of such program?

YES

NO

CLINTON COMMUNITY UNIT
SCHOOL DISTRICT 15

PROPOSITION TO ISSUE
$16,700,000 SCHOOL

BUILDING BONDS

Shall the Board of Education of
Clinton Community Unit School
District Number 15, DeWitt,
Macon and Logan Counties,
Illinois, build and equip a new
school building and improve the
site thereof, alter, repair and
equip the Clinton High School
Building, and demolish the
Webster and Washington
Elementary School Buildings and
issue bonds of said School
District to the amount of
$16,700,000 for the purpose of
paying the costs thereof?

YES

NO

CITY OF ATLANTA

Shall the City of Atlanta have the
authority to arrange for the supply
of electricity for its residential and
small commercial retail
customers who have not opted
out of such program?

YES

NO

PUBLIC QUESTION(S)

CITY OF LINCOLN

Shall the City of Lincoln have the
authority to arrange for the supply
of electricity for its residential and
small commercial retail
customers who have not opted
out of such program?

YES

NO

CITY OF MOUNT PULASKI

Shall the City of Mount Pulaski
have the authority to arrange for
the supply of electricity for its
residential and small commercial
retail customers who have not
opted out of such program?

YES

NO

VILLAGE OF EMDEN

Shall the Village of Emden have
the authority to arrange for the
supply of electricity for its
residential and small commercial
retail customers who have not
opted out of such program?

YES

NO

VILLAGE OF MIDDLETOWN

Shall the Village of Middletown
have the authority to arrange for
the supply of electricity for its
residential and small commercial
customers who have not opted
out of such program?

YES

NO

VILLAGE OF SAN JOSE

Shall the Village of San Jose
have the authority to arrange for
the supply of electricity for its
residential and small commercial
retail customers who have not
opted out of such a program?

YES

NO
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