CITY OF LINCOLN
REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING
AGENDA
FEBRUARY 16, 2021
CITY HALL COUNCIL CHAMBERS
7:00 PM

Due to the State of lllinois Phase 4 of the Coronavirus Covid-19 Precautions the City of Lincoln Council will need to continue
setting 6’ apart in conducting a Regular City Council Meeting. If you would like to participate in public participation you may
come to City Hall 2" Floor and remain in the hall way until you are called upon. Once you speak you will be asked to leave the
meeting. You may still call in for Public Participation by dialing 217-735-1612 extension 1. We ask that you keep your phone

SRR s

muted until you are recognized to speak by the Mayor. You may view the meeting from Channel 5 or from the city website

https://lincolnil.zov/livestream

Call to order

Roll Call

Pledge of Allegiance

Public Participation

Consent Agenda by Omnibus Vote

AII items under the Consent Agenda are considered to be routine in nature and/or non-controversial and will be
approved by one motion. If any one wishes to have a separate vote on any item, it will be pulled from the Consent
Agenda and voted on separately.

b

10.
11.
12,
13.

Payment of Bills
Ordinance and Resolution
Bids
Reports
A. City Treasurer’s Report for January, 2021
B. City Clerks Report for January, 2021
C. Department Head Reports for January, 20201
New Business/Communications
A. Approval of Change Order #2 to the CSO Improvement Contract with Plocher Construction in an amount
not to exceed $15,755.50.
B. Approval of Lincoln Economic Development Grant to Cafe’ Billiards in the amount of $3,599.00, Knecht
Construction in the amount of $7,500.00 and El Mazatlan Restaurant in the amount of $3,100.00.
C. Approval of the replacement of the current City Credit Card from American Express with credit card
issued by Heartland Bank and Trust.
D. Approval of RFP from Stone River Group to act as broker for obtaining electrical supply for City of Lincoln
buildings.
E. Approval of Memorandum of Understanding between the City of Lincoln and the F.O.P. Local 208
regarding residency requirements for Lincoln Police Officers.
Discussion
Announcements
Executive Session 2 (C) (2)

Adjournment

We welcome the participation of persons with disabilities at all City of Lincoln meetings. If auxiliary aid or service is
required for most effective participation and communication, please notify the City Clerks’ Office at 217-735-2815
or cityclerk@lincolnil.gov no later than 48 hours prior to the meeting time.




CITY CLERK
LINCOLN. ILLINOIS

FEB 0 5 2021

RECEIVED

CONTRACTING DOCUMENTS

Document 00 94 10 — Change Order
Change Order No. 2

Date of Issuance:

Owner: City of Lincoln

Contractor:

Engineer:  Crawford, Murphy & Tilly, Inc.
Project: CSO Improvements

Effective Date:

Owner's Contract No.:
Contractor’s Project No.:
Engineer's Project No.:
Contract Name:

18003702-00

The Contract is modified as follows upon execution of this Change Order:
Description: Contractor shall increase pile length, add grout to effluent box and increase beam size.

Attachments: [List documents supporting change]

CHANGE IN CONTRACT PRICE

Original Contract Price:

$ 13,300,000.00

CHANGE IN CONTRACT TIMES
[note changes in Milestones if applicable]
Original Contract Times:
Substantial Completion:

Ready for Final Payment:

days or dates

[Increase] [Decrease] from previously approved Change
Orders No. _0 toNo._1:

¢ 1,312.50

[Increase] [Decrease] from previously approved Change
Orders No.___ toNo.__:
Substantial Completion:

Ready for Final Payment:

days

Contract Price prior to this Change Order:

$ 13,301,312.50

Contract Times prior to this Change Order:
Substantial Completion:

Ready for Final Payment:

days or dates

[Increase] [Decrease] of this Change Order:

¢ _15,755.50

[Increase] [Decrease] of this Change Order:
Substantial Completion:

Ready for Final Payment:

days or dates

Contract Price incorporating this Change Order:

S 13,317,068.00

Contract Times with all approved Change Orders:
Substantial Completion:

Ready for Final Payment:

days or dates
RE MENDED: ACCEPTED: ACCEPTED:
By: % b_n/H By: By:
Engineer (if requiret!') Owner (Authorized Signature) Contractor (Authorized Signature)
Title:  Project Manager Title Title
Date: February 9, 2021 Date Date
Approved by Funding Agency (if
applicable)
By: Date:
Title:

Lincoln/18003702-00

00 94 10-1

CSO Improvements
Change Order



MEMORANDUM

TO: Acting Mayor and Council of the City of Lincoln
FROM: Peggy Bateman, City Clerk

MEETING
DATE: February 9, 2021
RE: Government/Municipality Credit Card

Background:  Years ago The City of Lincoln acquired American Express Credit Cards.
American Express charges an annual fee per card which is costing the city $315.00
per year. The city is currently paid up with American Express until August, 2021.

I would like to replace the American Express Credit Cards with Heartland Bank and
Trust which is affiliated with State Bank of Lincoln. Heartland Bank Credit Card
provides an option that requires no annual fee. The application process with
Heartland Bank requires board minutes of approval to apply for a credit card.

City Council Recommendation: | ask for the approval of the replacement of City credit
card from American Express with Heartland Bank and Trust to save the City from
paying any annual fee.




City of Lincoln, IL 2021 Electric RFP

Quote Date: 1/29/2021
Company Term Price Product Sample Contract Customer Portal

AEP

12| $ 0.04140 |Fixed AliIn  |Yes Yes

24 0.04163 |Fixed All In

W

36| 5 0.04204 |Fixed All In

Homefield/Dynegy

12| S 0.04395 |Fixed AllIn  |Yes No

24| 5 0.04506 |Fixed All In

36| $ 0.04622 |Fixed All In

Direct Energy

12| $§ 0.04457 |Fixed Allin  |Yes Yes

24| $ 0.04471 [Fixed All In

36| $ 0.04517 |Fixed All In

Mid Amereican

12| $ 0.04524 |Fixed Aliln |Yes No

24 0.04527 [Fixed All In

W

36| 5 0.04549 [Fixed All In

Nordic Energy

12 |No Bid Fixed Al In

24 |No Bid Fixed All In

36 |No Bid Fixed All In

Constellation

12|No Bid Fixed All In

24 |No Bid Fixed All In

36|No Bid Fixed All In

Phone: 800-828-6719 - Fax: 866-900-8141 - email: stonerivergroup@aol.com

Rate quotes are only estimates. Rate will not be locked in until contract is signed. Rates are only valid for day they are
quoted. Usage is only an estimate based on historcial usage.




- Electric Supply Quote -

Account Name City of Lincoln IL

Quote Name City of Lincoln IL 2021 1-29-2021
Created Date 1/29/2021

Utility Ameren

Utility Default Rate  $0.050190

Justin Cheger

Sales Rep

Supplier Utility Accounts
1/20/2021 | Ameren E 4| 4,230,173.00{
112912021 | AEP Ameren 43| 4,280,173.00}
1/29/2021 AEP iAmeren 43? 4,280,173.00?
1/29/2021 | Homefield %Ameren | 43! 4,280,173.00 |
1/29/2021 | Direct Energy | Ameren 43% 4,280,173.00

1/29/2021 Direct Energy | Ameren 43 4,280,173.00 |
1/29/2021 Homefield Ameren 43 4,280,173.00

1/29/2021 Direct Energy |Ameren 43 4,280,173.00|
1/29/2021 MidAmerican | Ameren 43 4,280,173.00 ][
1/29/2021 MidAmerican | Ameren 43 4,280,173.00 i
1/29/2021 MidAmerican Ameren 43 4,280,173.00

112912021 Homefield  |Ameren | 43! 4,280,173.00

Agent Code 951350

Current Supplier ~ AEP

Current Supply Rate $0.044230

Usage Length Start Date

12{311/2021
24 3/1/2021
36 3/1/2021
12 3/1/2021
12| 31172021
24, 3/1/2021
2431112021
36 3172021
12 3/1/2021
24: 3172021
36 | 3/1/2021
36 3/1/2021

REIG
$0.041400
$0.041630
$o.o42040!

i $o.0439501
$0.044570

| $0.044710
$0.045060
$0.045170
$0.045240
$0.045270
$0.045490

' $0.046220

$37,622.72
$36,638.28

$34,883.41
$26,708.28 |
$24,064.57
$23,455.35
$21,957.29
§21,486.47
$21,186.86
$21,058.45
$20,116.81
$16,992.29

Savings Vs Utility Savings vs Supplier

$12,112.89
$11,128.45

$9,373.58

$1,108.45
($1,455.26)
($2,054.48)
($3,552.54)
($4,023.36)
($4,322.97)
($4,451.38)
($5,393.02)
($8,517.54)

The prices included in this quote are only good for the business day they are quoted. Prices are subject to change on daily basis. Savings are

only estimates based on historical usage and are not guaranteed.



Customer: City of Lincoln IL
/\/{\\ Date: 1/28/2021

L/i Annual Usage: 3642920
o 43

Number of Accounts:

Month: Ameren Defualt Rate: Usage Customer Rate: Monthly Savings:
January 2019 0.05532 $ -
February 2019 0.05431 $ -
March 2019 0.05207| 419704 $0.04423| $ 3,290.48
April 2019 0.05183| 393017 $0.04423( $ 2,986.93
May 2019 005016| 351000 $0.04423| $ 2,081.43
June 2019 0.05016| 359125 $0.04423| $ 2,129.61
July 2019 0.05016| 288597 $0.04423| § 1,711.38
August 2019 0.05016| 307678 $0.04423| $ 1,824.53
September 2019 0.05016| 317299 $0.04423( $ 1,881.58
October 2019 0.05315| 346437 $0.04423| $ 3,090.22
November 2019 0.05315| 398470 $0.04423| $ 3,554.35
December 2019 0.05315( 461593 $0.04423| $ 4,11741
Average 2019 0.05198166667 3642920
Total:| $ 26,667.92

Electric Supply Prices

Ameren Defualt Rate: == Customer Rate:




A /.\ Customer: | City of Lincoin IL
AP Date: 01/28/2021
! Annual Usage: 4215139
L——""-—__“’ Number of Accounts: 43
Month: Ameren Defualt Rate: Usage Customer Rate: Monthly Savings:
January 2020 $0.05315 431230 $0.04423 $3,846.57
February 2020 $0.05315 443587 $0.04423 $3,956.80
March 2020 $0.05315 374040 $0.04423 $3,336.44
April 2020 $0.05315 387788 $0.04423 $3,459.07
May 2020 $0.05315 354678 $0.04423 $3,163.73
June 2020 $0.04903 328470 $0.04423 $1,576.66
July 2020 $0.04903 293842 $0.04423 $1,410.44
August 2020 $0.04903 284173 $0.04423 $1,364.03
September 2020 $0.04903 312353 $0.04423 $1,499.29
October 2020 $0.05103 300275 $0.04423 $2,041.87
November 2020 $0.05103 329856 $0.04423 $2,243.02
December 2020 $0.05103 374847 $0.04423 $2,548.96
Average $0.05198 351262 $0.04423
| Total:| $30,446.87|

Electric Supply Prices
Ameren Defualt Rate: == Customer Rate:

$0.06000

$0.05500 r

i

$0.05000 !k
|
$0.04500 -
!

i
$0.04000
January 2020 March 2020 May 2020 July 2020 September 2020 November 2020




Account  Location

Masch 2018 April 2019 May 2018 June 2019 July 2018 August2019 September 2019 October 2019 November 2018 December 2010 2019 Total January 2020 Fabruary 2020 Miasch 2028 April 2020 May 2020 June 2020 July 24

61058010 810 6th St Parking Lot 500 558 %05 818 405 514 583 898 748 B8 8,187 e 745 580
245142108 103 N Chicago Amérack 2244 1483 1,368 1,564 21713 1,697 1,735 1525 2280 2743 18,812 2814 2678 1908
277986294 101 S Logan St Traffic Light 177 188 188 182 162 196 & 180 187 187 1,/ 187 185 178
413587373 2892 Woodiawn Traffic Light 00 41 501 47 an 580 535 582 809 848 8378 550 S48 o7
623008043 2338 N Kickapoo Wastwater 2,158 2,008 2034 1583 1,084 83 ;<] 1022 1885 1,887 15473 2440 2100 1873
820140007 505 5th St Traffic Light ki 245 23 2680 234 240 ] 243 228 258 2308 218 287 24

1105906008 150 W Kickspoo St Sawer N3ee? 288201 281,751 276401 219,283 237318 240314 263,043 283440 337,278 2,734,885 304,280 52 27,481
1384167014 700 Browdway St Lights 1,712 15884 1588 1454 1,488 1.822 1838 2074 2382 2383 18.302 223 1863 1,787
1488300852 111 N Hamdtion Garage s70 820 o74 383 463 a1 748 5% 865 1338 7480 1381 138 1.2¢9
1801827854 1868 Woodtawn Trafic Light 1 248 284 251 241 258 240 247 268 282 2,538 250 240 281
1744603852 700 Broadway 2288 281 2120 2108 1838 2074 2217 2348 313 4832 23,198 3077 2381 1308
1811028018 1520 St 11 6t TrafMic Light 497 454 a7 405 403 83 480 883 77 721 5148 &4 542 534
1826832172 1600 5th St Traffic Light 822 &3 554 580 547 805 83 %3 748 L) 8531 s 78 «3
1861022005 1586 Woodiewn Rd Light 3,087 2,888 2,187 253 2462 3,085 3002 3382 3867 3g83 30,084 3212 1897 1,840
2201129054 3007 Hickex Dr Tropics 8ign 1,353 1374 1,488 1,280 1303 1381 1,201 1,238 1385 1438 13,408 1268 1,208 1382
2523008040 620 N Adams Meirose Park o o o 0 o [ e 9 0 0 o o 0 o
2523700002 825 N Union St Sewsr 8478 8813 4987 448 1301 2,158 2121 3588 3218 4808 4277 6,085 5384 4,825
2627084001 2800 Woodlawn Rd Light 628 014 27 551 555 656 850 kgl 818 a8 6884 708 846 858
2773620652 107 Woodlawn Unlon Light 207 845 797 853 784 843 9806 "7 842 1083 8877 o0 842 Bsa
2847044008 1202 Woodtawn Taylor Light 614 883 624 408 4% 575 534 61t 84 735 5874 845 a7 710
3135120004 3101 Woodiawn Light 448 444 460 448 428 A70 4 4710 524 588 4,888 518 488 475
3401407373 229 N Kickapoo Postvill Park 08 130 138 180 143 147 7 s al &7 1422 B0 L 81
3634602812 803 Keokuk Logan Light 600 552 584 B3 5% 842 813 872 788 742 8288 687 815 87
3773106008 1301 5th 5t Posndlls Park o o & o o o = 0 ) o 104 a Q o
5088817008 1470 Loop 55 Sewer 0378 0630 9264 823 7830 5884 5219 5742 88% 8417 80368 B8 8818 7.3688
8081717008 2817 Woodiswn Burwell Sewst 2073 2084 182 1704 1361 1503 1408 1888 1877 2213 17.860 2209 2108 2087
8354870413 700 N Kickapoo Light 518 512 se2 476 478 488 57t 47 866 683 5470 83 828 a4
8800826018 101 N Chicago St Dapot. 2078 282 4881 732 1003t 8,344 8070 2891 2834 2,750 51,728 ™3 2800 2037
7748902007 Feldman Westwater Sewar 77 825 508 436 284 8 333 517 864 708 5387 83 70 ar
8223214253 $38 Woodlawn Light 260 %7 324 M7 308 X8 28 312 334 3% 3150 301 284 250
8231411453 415 Broadway Light 368 3’ 318 nr 382 %7 ko) L) 1,328 s 5238 37 > ar
BAB2245008 1607 N Jefferscn 5t Bewer 1278 1,%5 1221 1178 a7 1,101 887 1,088 1088 1241 1,314 1167 848 a5
8540285004 120 N Kickapoo 12 20 1% z 18 20 L1 2 a3 135 288 18 1 1%
$872040652 508 Broadwey 51 Lights. 545 52 8 4“0 48 468 Lir] s 700 8% 5,584 887 n 210
8707286017 710 % Bl Polce St 28304 24007 20788 2088 18282 19723 19128 28,820 38584 40,138 258518 41858 37705 31473
B783800008 2000 N Kickapoo Mayfalr Sewer 4,75% 829 3837 2868 1220 1,027 1181 1443 3000 3680 28828 5257 4327 3470
8663073023 313 Limit St Gerage 1,780 8,200 5240 4080 4840 4,280 4,080 30 6880 6520 48,600 7280 9,880 8200
2083011532 100 Hickex Or Lights 849 448 579 534 531 a7 501 & 724 783 8,082 851 €80 ™=
9032345005 1300 Woodlewn Zion Sewer 2,338 2,34 1963 1854 1065 1172 1427 1821 2208 2,188 17832 2053 2088 1803
8374532003 308 Palmer Ave Sewsr 1188t 12,568 855 4605 2587 2,703 28% 6,103 8258 10867 7,821 12262 10250 8,478
396200007 1808 Pulaski 8t Bewer 6,049 003 6,803 3,001 1025 1,201 1885 4,200 4,861 B108 50,000 708 7.187 5,100
8785480613 857 Broadwell Lendwaste 4 2 a 34 <@ 21 24 02 138 & 347 75 8 k]
9816157611 BT Haliman Lights %08 501 490 480 448 558 624 ™ 805 B85 5280 ™= 828 820

Totls 419,704 2383017 351,000 350,125 288507 307,678 317,208 348,437 96,470 46150 3,842,920 431,230 443587 374,040

2018 Usage 3,842,820
2020 Usaga 4215148

613
1,538
1e7

1,588
1,238

7818

28707
4471
5,600

2262

14,150
14,202

387,768

503
1308

1,201
a2
kol

4“7

720 500
1804 19%
184 208
537 507
110 10
242 231
261817 222255
1454 1803
7 ez
47 2
784 878
198 17
545 548
15% 151
103 118
[}

1652 1837
574 58
] 808
587 582
460 4“5
180 148
o8 354
4 ]
8537 3708
1413 1210
4”0 sa7
8,200 7162
304 20
318 224
188 189
485 363
8 17
151 147
20870 18,809
1401 120
4720 4900
w es?
1428 1314
3/ 34w
1843 1268
2 £’}
564 524
RBATO 203,842

August 2020 September 2020 October 2020 November 2020 December 2020 2020 Yotal

580 831 842 1,082 1,157 BAW
1,688 1.714 1,308 1,238 2,774 23305
182 185 192 186 210 2287
£ 581 2 720 o2 128
827 -3 &0 1,120 1424 17813
258 28 ze 24 2% 2680
22142 247,532 231,808 244,208 283507 3,177,850
1718 183 2220 2218 2530 23540
1,000 1,054 ) 1,080 1088 13078
25 20 250 260 400 17
854 366 1,088 1212 2300 16,808
a0 47 88 545 816 4907
51 65 708 787 812 7838
1,748 1,870 2334 2342 2,705 242%
1.287 1178 1318 1,231 1304 15,218
[ o o 0 0 [
188 1384 1788 1547 1648 -y
s7 538 a4 B2 800 8974
e 608 75 B84 1137 Bot2
810 ] 763 71 851 7857
419 %8 - 513 &8 5801
138 1 <} -] (<] 1.208
e o4 &7 a0 8880
[ o o [ ° 0
5260 4881 4600 sea7 7862 803
1003 1,168 1312 1,382 1703 19,286
508 598 01 738 884 1248
5456 2883 2574 239 2,160 034
21 35 528 o8 760 8008
304 m £ 2% ] 3883
20 2 284 788 3044
283 0 s 204 415 6135
19 18 W7 4 28
155 20 208 240 265 3018
1983 24350 2800 A 46978 345,508
1097 1048 1,248 1840 26% 208
8,040 5080 8,380 8,520 7,040 71,320
77 780 801 ) 1,008 0088
1238 1,188 1318 1311 1888 19,838
244 2371 3885 5,530 8812 83482
1.198 1324 1,489 2818 aan 50417
£ 24 % ) 10 481
578 1 708 ) 88 750
84173 N2 300278 329,805 374,847 4215140



CHIEF OF POLICE PAUL ADAMS

To: Acting Mayor Tracy Welch and Lincoln City Council
From: Chief of Police, Paul Adams
Meeting Date: February 16, 2021

Re: FOP Lodge 208 MOU

Background

Law Enforcement throughout the Country is in great demand of qualified applicants for
hire. Retention of good employees along with recruitment of new employees is very
difficult given the media’s negative portrayal of law enforcement. Throughout the
Country officers are retiring earlier and not enough young people want to pursue
careers to fill the gap creating opportunities nationwide for officers to “lateral” to other
agencies with better pay, benefits, and location.

We are also in great demand for diversity in our departments and with such a small
diverse population in our own community we have to look outside for applicants.

We are currently accepting lateral applications and the past two lateral testing resulted
in only one applicant for each test.

Analysis/Discussion

Nationwide law enforcement agencies are relaxing residency requirements to attract
applicants for new police cadets and those that are already experienced officers. Our
current 15 miles residency requirement limits the City of Lincoln. Anyone living outside
that may have established residence would love to work here, but do not want to move
due to a multitude of personal restraints.

In discussion with the Illinois Fraternal Order of Police Labor Council, Lodge #208,
although it would be a benefit for officers to be able to live further away from Lincoln,
most would not move further away as it will be more of a drive to an already long day.
We may see officers move inside or close to Lincoln after being employed due to the
longer drive. However we would have some that may move closer to a larger city due to
a significant other’s commute to a larger city. Nonetheless the FOP has proposed a
memorandum of understanding (MOU) that would benefit the City of Lincoln by
requiring officers who leave within two years of being hired to reimburse the City of
Lincoln for training, non-reusable equipment, and other expenses at a prorated rate
over the two years. In response they requested that officers may live anywhere within
surrounding counties of Logan County.

710 5th ST ¢ LINCOLN e IL e 62656
PHONE (217)732-2151 ¢ FAX (217)732-4589
www lincolnil.gov/police



LINCOLN POLICE DEPARTMENT

CHIEF OF POLICE PAUL ADAMS DEPUTY CHIEF MATTHEW VLAHOVICH

Fiscal Impact

Although officers not living in Lincoln, IL, may not be contributing to local sales and
property taxes, the City needs a qualified diverse police department which is
immeasurable to growing our community and keeping our citizens safe. We are
currently understaffed and need to hire an employee immediately with several
retirements in the next few years along with those officers already leaving as they
pursue better salaries and benefits, which the City is not in a financial position to offer.

The City will save up to $3000 for officers that do get hired and then “bounce” to
another agency within two years, but otherwise this agreement would not affect the

current budget.

Recommendation
Approve the lllinois Fraternal Order of Police Labor Council, Lodge #208, Memorandum

of Understanding in regards to Residence and Training Reimbursement.

710 5th ST ¢ LINCOLN e IL ¢ 62656
PHONE (217)732-2151  FAX (217)732-4589

www.lincolnil.gov/police



Residency and Training Reimbursement, City of Lincoln and the Illinois FOP Labor Council
Two Pages

MEMORANDUM OF UNDERSTANDING

MEMORANDUM OF UNDERSTANDING entered on this __ day of
2021 by and between the City of Lincoln, Illinois (“the Employer™) and the Illinois Fraternal Order
of Police Labor Council (“the Union”) or collectively (“Parties”) is as follows:

WHEREAS, the Parties recognize the need to expand the Employer’s residency
requirement in order to appeal to a larger amount of applicants; and

WHEREAS, the Employer also desires a training reimbursement provision be added to
the contact; and

WHEREAS, the parties wish to commemorate those understandings without making
changes to the body of their existing collective bargaining agreement.

THEREFORE, the parties agree:
1) Contract to be Amended: This Memorandum of Understanding shall amend the

parties’ current collective bargaining agreement. Disputes shall be resolved through the grievance
procedure of the collective bargaining agreement.

2) Amendment: The parties’ collective bargaining agreement shall be amended in the
following manner:

A) 27.9  Training Reimbursement
(a)  The following shall take effect upon ratification of this MOU and apply
to any emplovee hired thereafter:

b During the first two (2) vears after receiving initial training at a police

academy, should an Emplovee leave the employment of the Emplover for any

reason, other than disability or layoff, the Emplovee shall repay non-
reimbursed monies spent by the Employer for training and non-reusable
equipment provided.

(c) Such reimbursement shall be pro-rated as follows:

Emplovee leaves within the first six (6) | 100% of costs
months after completion of police academy
Emplovee leaves between six (6) and twelve | 75% of costs
(12) months after completion of police
academy

Emplovee leaves between twelve (12) and | 50% of costs
eighteen (18) months after completion of

police academy




Residency and Training Reimbursement, City of Lincoln and the Illinois FOP Labor Council
Two Pages

Emplovee leaves between eighteen (18) and | 25% of costs

twenty-four (24) months after completion of
police academy

Any and or all the above may be waived by the Chief of Police and Mayor.

Reimbursement shall be provided through a deduction in the applicable employee’s
final paycheck. Should the reimbursement amount owed be greater than the final paycheck,

the remaining amount shall be paid by the applicable emplovee within thirty (30) calendar
days of the date of the final paycheck.

B) 27.6  Residency

Officers shall establish and maintain a primary residence anywhere within the following
counties: Logan, Tazewell, Mason, McLean, DeWitt, Macon, Sangamon, or Menard fifteen
@5)miles-of the-corporate limits-of the-City-of Lineeln; verified through mortgage documents,

title documents, property tax records or lease agreement. For newly hired officers, the primary
residence shall be established within 90 days of completion of their probationary period. Any time
extensions of residency requirement must be approved in writing by the Chief of Police or his
designee. Regardless of the provisions of this Section, employees shall not be subjected to any
residency requirement which is stricter than the requirement in place at the time of their
employment, as provided in Illinois statute.

3) Any sections of the current collective bargaining agreement that are not specified above,
shall remain the same.

FOR THE EMPLOYER (CITY OF FOR THE UNION (FOP LABOR
LINCOLN, ILLINOIS) COUNCIL)

Signature Date IL FOP Labor Council Date
Signature Date Signature Date
Signature Date Signature Date



